
$295,000 - 5142 Big Sky Drive, Abilene
MLS® #20635695 

$295,000
4 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,801 sqft
Residential on 0.24 Acres

Country Village, Abilene, TX

Don't miss out on this incredible 4-bedroom,
2-bathroom home in Wylie! Immaculately
maintained and ready for its new owner, plus
this residence boasts a beautifully clean
interior. The living room features a striking
ledger stone accent wall, while the kitchen is
both inviting and spacious, boasting a wealth
of cabinets, granite countertops, upgraded
appliances, a water softener, and a reverse
osmosis system. Additional highlights include
a tankless water heater, a generously sized
covered patio perfect for entertaining, a
convenient outdoor shed for storing your tools
and equipment, and much more. Don't
wait...this gem of a home should not last long!
Easy to see and ready for you to move in now!
3.62 PERCENT VA ASSUMABLE LOAN FOR
QUALIFIED BUYERS TOO!!!

Built in 1992

Essential Information

Days on Market 495

Cumulative Days on Market 95

HOA None

MLS® # 20635695

Price $295,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,801



Acres 0.24

Year Built 1992

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Traditional

Status Closed

Community Information

Address 5142 Big Sky Drive

Subdivision Country Village

City Abilene

County Taylor

State TX

Zip Code 79606-5330

Amenities

Utilities City Sewer, City Water, Cable Available

# of Garages 2

Garages 2-Car Double Doors, Garage Door Opener, Garage Faces Front

Has Pool Yes

Interior

Interior Features Granite Counters, Open Floorplan, Built-in Features, Cable TV Available,
High Speed Internet Available, Pantry, Walk-In Closet(s)

Bedroom / BathroomDual Sinks, Jetted Tub, Separate Shower, Walk-in Closet(s)

Floors Carpet, Ceramic Tile

Heating Central, Electric

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Fireplaces Living Room, Gas Logs

Exterior

Exterior Features Covered Patio/Porch

Lot Description Cul-De-Sac

Roof Composition

Construction Brick

Foundation Slab

Listing Details



Listing Agent Janet Batiste

Listing Office JMAX Realty Group LLc
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